
Forms ID 995A and ID 995B duly
completed;
 Copy of the applicant’s passport;
 Copy of acceptance letter from
the applicant's school;
 Proof of your financial condition;
 One passport sized recent
photograph;
Consent letter duly signed by
parents for appointment of
guardian, if the applicant is under
the age of 18;
 A photocopy of proof of
accommodation arrangements;
An undertaking from Sponsor
institution providing
accommodation, if the applicant
is under 18.

 Photocopy of the sponsor’s Hong
Kong identity card;
 Photocopy of the sponsor’s travel
document;
 Photocopy of proof of the
sponsor’s financial standing.

 If your sponsor is an individual,      
 following  documents in addition
to the above:  
                                             

STUDENT VISA

Documents Required

Processing Time

Normally takes 4 to 6 weeks from
the date of submission. Student
visa holders are not allowed to
work unless getting a consent
from Immigration Department.

www.chandrawatpartners.com

International students accepted
by recognized Hong Kong
universities, private and local
schools whether full time/short
term or exchange program
should apply for student visa.
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